DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES BID #2324-02 - NON FOOD BID ITEMS
AWARD SHEET - TERM: JULY 13, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024

PROJECTED PRODUCT MEETS
1 USAGE 2023- BUY AMERICAN
2024 UNIT OF PREFERRED | PROVISION (YES AWARDED
ITEM #| CATEGORY DESCRIPTION MEASURE BRAND OR NO) uom BRAND BID STOCK # PRICE PER UOM VENDOR
BAGS - 1 GAL. PLASTIC, ZIPPER SEAL, COMMERCIAL, 2.5-2.7
2 | Hoo1 | NN-FOOD 49 MIL (FREEZER) FDA APPROVED, SAMPLE REQUIRED PREF. 100/PK ELKAY NO 250 ELKAY IPGALLON 13.99 APPCO
ELKAY #F41012K
3 | HO02 | NN-FOOD 6 BAGS - BROWN PAPER, 6 LB., 6"x11 1/16"x3 5/8" 500/PK DURO YES 500 DURO UCco6P 16.49 APPCO
BAGS - FOIL/PAPER, 6" x 3/4" x 6 1/2", SANDWICH, N PAPERCON OR
HO003 | NN-FOOD 4 1000/CS E 1 BROWN EDB X PP
4 5 PRINTING / BROWN YES 000 ROW S 48.97 APPCO
5 | Hoo4 4 BAGS, HAMBURGER FOIL 1000/CS BAGCRAFT YES 1000 BROWN SEHB APPCO
NN-FOOD 48.97
BAGS, HOT DOG SANDWICH, 31/2" W X 1 1/2" D X 8 1/2",
6 | HOO5 |\ FooD 3 FOIL, BAGCRAFT MFR #300455 PREFERRED 1000/CS BAGCRAFT VES 1000 BROWN SEHDB 43.49 APPCO
7 | Hooe NNFOOD 16 BAGS, SANDWICH, 6X6 3/4 1000/CS BAGCRAFT YES 1000 BROWN BC317508 16.89 APPCO
8 | Hoo7 NNFOOD 10 BAGS, SNACK SIZE, ZIPLOC STYLE 270/CS ZIPLOC NO 250 ELKAY IPQUART 13.99 APPCO
9 | Hoos 3 BAG, WINDOW STYLE, PAPER, KRAFT, SINGLE SERVE, 5 in x Bagcraft® YES 500/CS BAGCRAFT/PAPER| 1028 48.80 HILL & MARKES
NN-FOOD 1.5inx7in, 500CT/CS EcoCraft® CON
BAGS - POLY, 8" X 4" X 18", CLEAR FOOD STORAGE, 1.1 MIL,
H NN-FOOD 1 .
10 | Hoo9 00 295 FDA APPROVED 000/CS ALUF YES 1000 XL AM8418 16.69 APPCO
11 | Ho1o | NN-FOOD 25 BAGS - QUART, PLASTIC, QUICK SEAL 500/CS ROYAL NO 500/CS ROYAL ROYZBQ78 23.25 HILL & MARKES
BAGS - SANDWICH, WAXED, 6" x 7", MOISTURE RESISTANT
12 | Ho11l | NN-FOOD 52 HOT/COLD ’ P OXT ’ 1000/BOX PAPERCON YES 6/1000/CS (BX) FISCHER FIS508 20.78 HILL & MARKES
BAGS - POLY,SADDLE, 6.5" X 7", CLEAR, FOOD GRADE, FAST
HO12 | NN-FOOD 2000/CS FOODHANDLER N 2 ELKAY HGSB 10.91 APP
13 0 LOADING, .85-1 MIL, TUFF GARD CLEAR, FDA APPROVED / 00 ° 000 GSB8SC 09 co
BAGS, POLY, SADDLE PACK DELI, CLEAR, 8" X10", LDPE MFR
14 | Ho13 | NN-FOOD 40 4DPOVSS 1000/CASE | ELKAY OR EQUAL NO 1000 ELKAY HGSB10585 15.49 APPCO
BAGS, 45 GAL, TRASH BAGS, HIGH DENSITY, 40"X48", 22 INTEPLAST OR
15 | Ho14 | NN-FOOD 0 ’ ’ ’ ’ ’ 150/CT YES 150/CS HERITAGE HIMP404822N 32.04 HILL & MARKES
MICRONS EQUAL
BAKING CUPS, PAPERBOARD, 6" TOP X 2 1/4" BOTTOM X 1
HO15 | NN-FOOD 1 20 SLV/CS REYNOLD! YE 1 FLUTED FLCCL . PP
16 7/8" DIAM., Round, White, 500/SLEEVE, MFR #FC225X600 / OLDS S 0,000 v ce 69.89 APPCO
17 | Hoie | NN-FOOD 5 BLEACH - CLOROX , CONCENTRATED, GERMICIDAL 3/121 0Z/CS CLOROX YES 3/121 CLOROX SC30966 22.49 APPCO
18 | Ho17 | NN-FOOD 30 BLEACH, CLOROX, ORIGINAL 4/128 0Z/CS CLOROX NO 6/1GL/CS BOARDWALK | HNM3406BRSCB 22.96 HILL & MARKES
19 | Ho18 | NN-FOOD 2 BOWL - 24 0Z BPA FREE, RECYCLABLE, CLEAR, BPA FREE, 126 SETS/CS | DART OR EQUAL YES 126/126 WELLCARE C24BCD 26.53 APPCO
PLASTIC BOWL WITH DOME LID, COLD (DART C24BCD) )
BOWL - 32 0Z, RECYCLABLE, CLEAR, BPA FREE, PLASTIC
20 | Ho19 | NN-FOOD 0 ’ ’ ’ ’ 126 SETS/CS | DART OR EQUAL YES 126/126 WELLCARE C32BCD 29.87 APPCO

BOWL WITH DETACHED DOME LID, COLD (DART C32BCD)
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21 | H020 | NN-FOOD 6 BOWL - SQUAT, 8 0Z, COLD, PET, CLEAR MFR #C8B 504/CS DART/SOLO YES 504/CS DART/SOLO WEEK LEAD TIME* 128.71 HILL & MARKES

22 | HO21 | NN-FOOD 11 BOWL - SQUAT, 12 0Z, COLD, PET, CLEAR, MFR #C12B 504/CS DART/SOLO YES 504/CS DART/SOLO DRTPET12B 101.91 HILL & MARKES
BOWL - LID FOR 8 AND 12 OZ COLD, PET, CLEAR BOWLS,

23 | H022 | NN-FOOD 26 Mc:R #ClGBD(L) 504/cs DART/SOLO YES 504/CS DART/SOLO DRTPET16BDL 73.03 HILL & MARKES
BOWL WITH LID COMBO - PAPER, HOT/COLD, 12 0Z, MFR

24 | H023 | NN-FOOD 0 , HOT/ ! 250/CS DART/SOLO YES 500 KARAT GFC10W 139.63 APPCO
#KHSB12A-2050 OR KHSB12A-J8000
BOWL - PAPER 12 OZ., HEAVY DUTY, SOLO (MFR #HB12-

25 | H024 | NN-FOOD 2067 Jsc())o1) 0 UTY, SOLO ( 1000/CS SOLO YES 1000 CHINET KE25780 87.19 APPCO
BOWLS, RECTANGULAR, 16 OZ., MICROWAVABLE,

H025 - NO 250 WELLCARE GEMT0601B 36.53 APPCO
26 NN-FOOD 20 8.79"X6.35"X1.24", POLYPROPYLENE, MFR #4541602 252/Cs ANCHOR PKG
27 | H026 | NN-FOOD 45 BOX, PIZZA, TRIANGLE FOR 8" SLICES 50/CS CHAMPION TRAY YES 400/CS PBI SALES PBI168 127.67 HILL & MARKES
PACKAGING CORP

28 | H027 | NN-FOOD 0 BOX, PIZZA, 16"X16"X2" 50/CS ULINE OR EQUAL YES 50/BL OF AMER MOH16162W 31.31 HILL & MARKES
CLEANER, SOAP PADS - HOTEL RESTAURANT QUALITY & SIZE

29 | H028 | NN-FOOD 0 ’ a 120/CS DISCO YES 12/10/CS DISCO DSCSP1210 33.01 HILL & MARKES
BRILLO - ONLY

30 | H029 | NN-FOOD 88 CLEANER, SPRAY, FOR STAINLESS STEEL, 20 0Z 12/Cs QUEST OR EQUAL YES 12 CHASE EPSSC 29.97 APPCO
CONTAINER- , 3 COMPARTMENT, CLEAR PLASTIC HINGED, 9

31 | HO30 | NN-FOOD 0 . 200/CS DART/SOLO YES 200 DART DAC95HT1 58.69 APPCO
1/2"x91/2"x3.3
CONTAINER, 3 COMPARTMENT, HINGED, 9"X9"

32 | HO31 | NN-FOOD 1 ’ ! ! ! 200/CS DART/SOLO YES 200 CHINET KE68025 47.89 APPCO
COMPOSTABLE

NTAINER, 3 COMPARTMENT, ALUMINUM, 6 1/2"X8 1/2", DURABLE PKG OR

33 | HO32 | NN-FOOD 27 co 3¢ / / 250/ct YES 250 SUNSHINE PCA739TP 44.69 APPCO
WITH LID EQUAL

34 | HO33 | NN-FOOD 22 LID, ALUMINUM BOARD, 6 1/2"X8 1/2" MFR #YL739 400/CS PACTIV YES 500 SUNSHINE PCAL739 19.97 APPCO
CONTAINER - CLEAR PLASTIC, ONE COMPARTMENT,

35 | HO34 | NN-FOOD 14 ) ., 500/CS DART/SOLO YES 200 DART C95HT1 58.69 APPCO
HINGED, 9" X 9" X 3 7/16", PET, HEAVY DUTY

36 | HO35 NN-FOOD 22 CONTAINER, 5X5 CLEAR PLASTIC HINGED, PET 500/CS DART/SOSO YES 500 DART C53PST1 49.97 APPCO
CONTAINER, CLEAR PLASTIC, ONE COMPARTMENT, HINGED,

37 | HO36 | NN-FOOD 2 6'%6" PET 500/CS DART/SOLO YES 500 DART C57PST1 50.93 APPCO

38 | Ho37 20 CONTAINER, DELI-VIEW SANDWICH WEDGE HINGED. CLEAR YES 250/CS ANCHOR ANP4511019 59.97 HILL & MARKES

NN-FOOD BASE WITH CLEAR FLAT LID, MFR #DV1101; SKU 4511019 250/CS ANCHOR PKG
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CONTAINER, SQUAT, 10 0Z, HOT/COLD PAPER W/VENTED HUHTAMAKI OR
39 | Ho38 | NN-FOOD 0 » SQUAT, HOT/ / 250 SETS/CS YES 1000 KARAT KDP10W 129.76 APPCO
PAPER LID EQUAL
CONTAINER, ALUMINUM FOIL FOOD CONTAINER W/BOARD DURABLE OR
H NN-FOOD 2 YES 200 SMART PCA527TP 29.99 APPCO
40 | HO39 00 0 LID, 24 OZ., 7" DIAM. DURABLE #270-25-L20X 00/CS EQUAL
41 | Ho4o 3 CONTAINER, 7" 1.5L.B ROUND CARRY-OUT, ALUMINUM 500/CS PACTIV YES 500 SMART PCA527TP 63.67 APPCO
NN-FOOD
42 | Hoal 3 COVER, BOARD, 7" FOIL LAM 500/CS PACTIV YES 500 SMART PCAL7527 18.29 APPCO
NN-FOOD
NTAINER, 3 COMPARTMENT, ALUMINUM,
43 | Ho42 25 €0 250/CS PACTIV YES 500 SMART PCA739 47.69 APPCO
RECTANGULAR, PCA739
NN-FOOD
1/2 LID ALUMI FOIL COVER, PCA1012 FOR P
44 | Hoa3 25 /2 LID ALUMINUM FOIL COVER, PCAL012 FOR PCA739 250/CS PACTIV YES 500 SMART PCAL739 19.97 APPCO
ABOVE
NN-FOOD
CONTAINER/LID COMBO PACK, 24 OZ OBLONG 3
45 | Hoaa 20 COMPARTMENT ALUMINUM TRAY WITH HIGH DIVIDER AND 200/CS PACTIV YES 200 SMART PCA739TP 44.69 APPCO
NN-FOOD BOARD LID, 200 CT, MFR #Y7139TP
CONTAINER, SQUAT , HOT/COLD PAPER, 8 0Z, MFR #HS4085
46 | HO45 | NN-FOOD 27 » SQUAT, HOT/ ’ 500/CS DART/SOLO YES 1000 KARAT GFC8W 69.84 APPCO
J8000 OR HS4085-2050
CONTAINER, SQUAT, HOT/COLD PAPER, 12 0Z, MFR
47 | Ho46 | NN-FOOD 60 2 / 500/CS DART/SOLO YES 500 KARAT GFC10W 59.99 APPCO
#HS4125-18000 OR HS4125-2050
CONTAINER, LID, TRANSLUCENT PP, VENTED NN- FOR DART
48 | Ho47 | NN-FOOD 0 P ’ 500/CS DART/SOLO YES 1000 KARAT CA16A 69.79 APPCO
8 0Z AND 12 OZ CONTAINERS LISTED ABOVE.
CONTAINER, LID, SPIRAL WOUND PAPER, NON-VENTED,
49 | Ho48 | NN-FOOD 5 HOT/COLD, MFR #CA16A-4000 - FOR DART 8 OZ AND 12 OZ 1000/CS DART/SOLO YES 500 SOLO 66.43 APPCO
CONTAINERS LISTED ABOVE
50 | Ho49 | NN-FOOD 0 CONTAINER, CLEAR PLASTIC DELI PRO KAL MICRO 12 OZ 10/50/CS FABRI-KAL YES 10/50/CS FABRIKAL FABPK12SC 50.08 HILL & MARKES
51 | Hos0 | NN-FOOD 0 CONTAINER, CLEAR PLASTIC DELI PRO KAL MICRO 8 OZ 10/50/CS FABRI-KAL YES 10/50/CS FABRIKAL FABPKSSC 34.83 HILL & MARKES
52 | Hos1 | NN-FOOD 7 CONTAINER, CLEAR PLASTIC DELI PRO KAL MICRO 16 OZ 10/50/CS FABRI-KAL YES 10/50/CS FABRIKAL FABPK16SC 42.00 HILL & MARKES
53 | Hos2 | NN-FOOD 0 LID, CLEAR PLASTIC, PP F/PRO-KAL MICRO DELI CONTAINERS 10/50/CS FABRI-KAL YES 10/50/CS FABRIKAL FABPPLID 21.99 HILL & MARKES
P, PARFAIT, COLD, 12 OZ ULTRACLEAR PET PLASTIC, (MFR
54 | HOs3 | NN-FOOD 0 ;:Péz) » COLD, 12 OZ ULTRAC STIC { 1000/CS SOLO YES 1000 SUNSHINE MUPET12626 59.89 APPCO
55 | Hos4 | NN-FOOD 0 JLID TO FIT 12 OZ PARFAIT CUP WITH SLIT (MFR #626TS) 1000/CS SOLO YES 1000 SUNSHINE AM626 36.49 APPCO
56 | HOs5 | NN-FOOD 0 CUP, POLY PAPER, HOT, 12 0Z, SOLO, MFR #412WN-2050 1000/CS SOLO NO 1000 SUNSHINE sua12c 48.83 APPCO
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57 | Hose | NN-FOOD 4 CUP, POLY PAPER, HOT, 10 0Z, SOLO, MFR #370W-2050) 1000/CS SOLO YES 1000 SUNSHINE sU410C 44.79 APPCO
LID TO FIT CUP FOR HOT 10, 12, 16 OZ CUPS, FLAT TEAR-
58 | HO57 | NN-FOOD 4 LID TO FIT CUP FO 1000/CS soLo YES 1000 SUNSHINE AML316FB 29.91 APPCO
BACK, MFR #LB3161-00007
LID, DOME STYLE, TO FIT 10, 12, 16 OZ SOLO HOT CUPS,
59 | Hoss | NN-FOOD 24 500/CS PERK YES 1000 DART AM316 33.64 APPCO
PERK MFR #PK56218CT
60 | HOs9 | NN-FOOD 0 CUPS, SOUFFLE, 1 0Z, PAPER PORTION CUPS 5000/CS SOLO OR GENPAC NO 5000 GENPACK SW100 36.53 APPCO
P, TRANSLUCENT, PLASTIC SOUFFLE CUP, 1 0Z, MFR
61 | HO60 | NN-FOOD 10 ;;JOOPC S 2500/CS SOLO/DART NO 2500 SUNSHINE MUPL100 16.53 APPCO
LID TO FIT CUP, SOUFFLE 1 0Z, CLEAR/TRANSLUCENT, BPA
62 | Hoe1 | NN-FOOD 10 ’ ’ / 2500/CS SOLO/DART NO 2500 SUNSHINE MUL100 16.83 APPCO
FREE, MFR #PL100N
P FFLE 2 OZ. CLEAR/TRANSLUCENT PLASTIC, BPA-
63 | Ho62 | NN-FOOD 15 cups, sou 0Z. CLEAR/TRANSLUC ol 2500/CS SOLO/DART NO 2500 SUNSHINE MUPL200 19.53 APPCO
FREE, MFR #8200
LID TO FIT_CUPS, SOUFFLE 2 OZ. CLEAR/TRANSLUCENT
64 | Ho63 | NN-FOOD 87 = - a4 2500/CS SOLO/DART NO 2500 SUNSHINE MUL200 17.99 APPCO
PLASTIC, BPA-FREE, MFR #PL200N
65 | Hos4 | NN-FOOD 0 CUP, SOUFFLE 4 OZ CLEAR/TRANSLUCENT PLASTIC 2500/CS soLo NO 2500 SUNSHINE MUPL400 39.87 APPCO
SOUFFLE CUP, CLEAR/TRANSLUCENT
66 | Hoe5 | NN-FOOD 12 ;'—LZ Z?ICF'M oz ’ / 2500/CS soLo NO 2500 SUNSHINE MUL400 26.29 APPCO
67 | Hoss | NN-FOOD 114 CUP, SOUFFLE 5.5 OZ CLEAR/TRANSLUCENT PLASTIC 2500/CS SOLO/DART NO 2500 SUNSHINE MUPL550 54.69 APPCO
LID TO FIT 5.5 OZ SOUFFLE CUP, CLEAR/TRANSLUCENT
68 | Ho67 | NN-FOOD 38 By ’ / 2500/CS SOLO/DART NO 2500 SUNSHINE MUL400 26.29 APPCO
69 | HO68 | NN-FOOD 80 CUPS, COLD DRINK, CLEAR PLASTIC 5 OZ. 2500/CS FABRIKAL YES 25/100/CS FABRIKAL FABRKS 66.67 HILL & MARKES
70 | Ho69 | NN-FOOD 80 LID TO FIT 5 0Z COLD DRINK CUP 2500/CS FABRIKAL YES 25/100/CS FABRIKAL FABLSNV 99.43 HILL & MARKES
71 | Ho70 | NN-FOOD 85 CUP, 10 OZ. CLEAR PLASTIC COLD 1000/CS FABRIKAL YES 1000 FINELINE FI311078 54.99 APPCO
72 | Ho71 | NN-FOOD 85 LID TO FIT CUP, 10 OZ. CLEAR PLASTIC COLD CUP 1000/CS FABRIKAL YES 1000 FINELINE FI3178FLS 29.99 APPCO
CUTLERY, - TEASPOON, HEAVYWEIGHT, WHITE, MFR
73 | Ho72 | NN-FOOD 20 ’ ’ ’ 1000/CS NP&PC YES 1000 SUNSHINE AMHS 13.99 APPCO

#BWKSPOONHW
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74 | HO73 | NN-FOOD 0 CUTLERY, - SOUP SPOON, HEAVYWEIGHT, WHITE 1000/CS NP&PC NO 1000 SUNSHINE AMHSS 13.99 APPCO
75 | HO74 | NN-FOOD 27 CUTLERY, - FORK, HEAVYWEIGHT, WHITE, MFR 1000/CS NP&PC NO 1000 SUNSHINE AMHF 13.99 APPCO
#BWKFORKHW :
76 | HoO75 | NN-FOOD 14 CUTLERY, - KNIFE, HEAVYWEIGHT, WHITE, MFR #DXEKH207 1000/CS NP&PC NO 1000 SUNSHINE AMH) 13.99 APPCO
CUTLERY, - FORK, MEDIUM WEIGHT, WHITE, IND.
77 | Ho76 | NN-FOOD 5 ’ ’ ’ ’ 1000/CS NP&PC NO 1000 SUNSHINE LEMFWR 12.99 APPCO
WRAPPED
CUTLERY, - KNIFE, MEDIUM WEIGHT, WHITE, IND.
78 | HO77 | NN-FOOD 2 ’ ’ ’ ’ 1000/CS NP&PC NO 1000 SUNSHINE LEMKWR 12.99 APPCO
WRAPPED
TLERY, - SOUP SPOON, MEDIUM WEIGHT, WHITE, IND.
79 | Ho78 | NN-FOOD 9 cu » ~SOUP SPOON, v GHT, ’ 1000/CS NP&PC NO 1000 SUNSHINE LEMSSWR 12.99 APPCO
WRAPPED
CUTLERY - SPORK, MEDIUM WEIGHT, WHITE, IND.
80 | HO79 | NN-FOOD 380 ’ ’ ’ 1000/CS NP&PC NO 1000 SUNSHINE LEMSPWR 16.89 APPCO
WRAPPED
TLERY, - TEASPOON, MEDIUM WEIGHT, WHITE, IND.
81 | HOs0 | NN-FOOD 70 cu ’ SPOON, v GHT, ’ 1000/CS NP&PC NO 1000 SUNSHINE LEMSWR 12.99 APPCO
WRAPPED
CUTLERY, SPORK KIT, SPORK, STRAW, NAPKIN MEDIUM
HO81 | NN-FOOD 1000/CS NP&P N 1 NSHINE LESK 13. APP
82 63 WEIGHT, WRAPPED / &PC o 000 SUNS SKS 3.39 co
CUTLERY KIT, FORK/KNIFE/SPOON/NAPKIN, MEDIUM
83 | Hos2 216 ’ /KNIFE/ / ’ 250/CASE GEN OR EQUAL NO 500 SUNSHINE LEMSKN 19.63 APPCO
WEIGHT, WRAPPED MFR #4KITMW
84 | HO83 | NN-FOOD 17 DELIMER LIMESCALE REMOVER FOR DISHWASHER 4/1 GAL/CS SIMONIZ YES 4/1GL/Cs SIMONIZ SMZ12125004 2633 HILL & MARKES
DETERGENT, DAWN PROFESSIONAL, MANUAL POT/PAN PROCTOR &
85 | Ho84 | NN-FOOD 110 ’ ’ 4/1 GAL/CS GAMBLE OR YES 4/1GL/Cs SIMONIZ SMZP2705004 20.12 HILL & MARKES
DISH LIQUID, ORIGINAL OR LEMON
EQUAL
DETERGENT, DAWN PROFESSIONAL, MANUAL POT/PAN PROCTOR &
DISH LIQUID, ORIGINAL OR LEMON (SECONDARY AWARD,
NN-FOOD 110 SH LIQUID, ORIGINAL O ON( ’ 4/1 GAL/CS GAMBLE OR YES 4 P&G PGJOY4 64.93
SIMONIZ PRODUCT UNACCEPTABLE TO FOOD SERVICE EQUAL
DIRECTORS.)
PROCTOR &
86 | Ho85 | NN-FOOD 0 DETERGENT, DAWN, PROFESSIONAL MANUAL POT/PAN 8/38 0Z/CS GAMBLE OR YES 8/3802/CS PROCTOR & PNG45112 54.83 HILL & MARKES
LIQUID DISH LIQUID, ORIGINAL OR LEMON SCENT EQUAL GAMBLE :
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GLISSEN OR
87 | Hos6 | NN-FOOD 540 DETERGENT, DISH MACHINE, PREMIUM HIGH/ALL TEMP 4 GAL/CS EQUAL YES 4/1GL/Cs BETCO BTC2447400 58.65 HILL & MARKES
88 | HO87 | NN-FOOD 3 DETERGENT, DISH MACHINE, HIGH TEMP 5GAL SURFLEX ONLY No Bid No Bid
89 | HO88 | NN-FOOD 3 DETERGENT, LEMON SHOT 4/1 GAL/CS SURFLEX ONLY No Bid No Bid
GLISSEN OR
90 | Ho89 | NN-FOOD 0 DISHWASHER RINSE AID, HIGH/ALL TEMP 4 GAL/CS EQUAL YES 4/1GL/CS BETCO BTC2617400 67.45 HILL & MARKES
91 | HO%0 | NN-FOOD 0 EésElgTFE;:zT g’;Ts'PDREAG\;(RBE&SjEé hﬁrﬂ:ﬁﬁ&FégiyoHHE:ng; MFR 8 BTL/CS SCJOHNSON OR YES 8/Cs scioHnson | SIN311836 *23 35.55 HILL & MARKES
’ ’ ’ EQUAL WEEK LEAD TIME* )
#SIN311836
92 | Ho91 | NN-FOOD 40 DRAIN MAINTAINER-DIGEST 4/1GL/Cs SIMONIZ YES 4/1GL/CS SIMONIZ SMZD0860004 28.98 HILL & MARKES
INTEGRA /BRUCO

93 | H092 | NN-FOOD 3 DRYING AGENT, HIGH TEMP RINSE FOR DISPENSER 5GAL ON(Y No Bid No Bid
94 | HO93 | NN-FOOD 30 GLOVES- VINYL, SMALL, LIGHT POWDER 1000/CS FOODHANDLER NO 10/100/CS FOODHANDLER 151102202 19.89 HILL & MARKES
95 | HO94 | NN-FOOD 0 GLOVES - VINLY, MEDIUM, LIGHT POWDER 1000/CS FOODHANDLER NO 10/100/CS FOODHANDLER 151102204 19.89 HILL & MARKES
96 | HO95 | NN-FOOD 1 GLOVES-VINYL, LARGE, LIGHT POWDER 1000/CS FOODHANDLER NO 10/100/CS FOODHANDLER 151102206 19.89 HILL & MARKES
97 | Ho96 | NN-FOOD 290 GLOVES-VINYL, EXTRA LARGE, LIGHT POWDER 1000/CS FOODHANDLER NO 10/100/CS FOODHANDLER 151102208 19.89 HILL & MARKES
98 | H097 | NN-FOOD 250 GLOVES, VINYL, SMALL NO POWDER 1000/CS FOODHANDLER NO 1000 PRC PIVGPFS 18.79 APPCO
99 | HO98 | NN-FOOD 270 GLOVES, VINYL, MEDIUM, NO POWDER 1000/CS FOODHANDLER NO 1000 PRC PIVGPFM 18.79 APPCO
100 | Ho99 | NN-FOOD 0 GLOVES, VINYL, LARGE, NO POWDER 1000/CS FOODHANDLER NO 1000 PRC PIVGPFL 18.79 APPCO
101 | H100 | NN-FOOD 0 GLOVES, VINYL, EXTRA LARGE, NO POWDER 1000/CS FOODHANDLER NO 1000 PRC PIVGPFXL 18.79 APPCO
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102 | H101 | NN-FOOD 0 GREEN SCRUBBER 6x9 - 20ct 60/CS DISCO NO 60 DISCO PUNSP 17.89 APPCO
SMILCO,
103 | H102 | NN-FOOD 20 HAIRNETS NYLON (SPECIFY COLORS AVAIL) 144/CS KEYSTONE OR NO 144 KEYSTONE CEHN 12.63 APPCO
EQUAL
104 | H103 [ NN-FOOD 1 HOT CUP SLEEVES FOR 10 OZ HOT CUPS 1000/CS SOLO OR EQUAL YES 1000 soLo SWSLEEVES 29.97 APPCO
105 | H104 | NN-FOOD 80 NAPKINS, 3-PLY DINNER NAPKIN, 17"LX16 1/4"W, PAPER, 2000/CS TORK YES 20/150/CS MORCON MOR3466 * 2-PLY, 27.78 HILL & MARKES
WHITE 28 100 CT BAGS/CASE (TORK MFR #NP7340P) 15"x17" ’
NAPKINS, EXPRESSNAP, EMBOSSED WHITE STANDARD
106 | H105 | NN-FOOD 95 ’ ’ 4000/CS TORK YES 6000 METRO BE2122 29.97 APPCO
WEIGHT, (TORK MFR #13680)
DISPENSER NAPKINS, INTERFOLD, 6 1/2" X 8 1/2", CHOICE
107 | H106 15 ’ 161/ 12" 6000/CS CHOICE KRAFT YES 6000 METRO BE2122N 29.97 APPCO
NN-FOOD KRAFT OR EQUAL
108 | H107 | NN-FOOD 37 OVEN CLEANER, EASYOFF BRAND ONLY 6/24 02/CS EASY OFF YES 6 EASY-OFF BOEZ 38.79 APPCO
OVEN MITTS, GLOVE STYLE, FIRE RESISTANT, 13", MFR #11M! ADMIRAL CRAFT
109 | H108 | NN-FOOD 34 ’ ’ P 1 EACH ADMIRAL CRAFT NO 1/EA . ADM11MFG13 5.87 HILL & MARKES
FG13 13" OVEN MITT
110 | H109 | NN-FOOD 24 OVEN MITT, 17" GLOVE STYLE, GRILL & OVEN, MFR #OMF-17 1 EACH ADMIRAL CRAFT NO 1/EA ADMIRAL CRAFT | ADM11MFG17 7.03 HILL & MARKES
111 | H110 50 PAIL, COMMERCIAL DOUBLE, GRAY, UTILITY, 17 QT, PLASTIC, NO 6/CS RUBBERMAID  p1700GRAY *2-3 LE 178.88 HILL & MARKES
NN-FOOD MFR #2617 GRA 1EA RUBBERMAID / = )
112 | H111 | NN-FOOD 112 PAN, STEAMTABLE ALUM HALF X 2.5" 100/CS DURABLE YES 100 HFA PCA6112 26.53 APPCO
113 | H112 | NN-FOOD 16 PAN LINERS ECO QUILON PANKRAFT 16"X24" 1000/CS PAPERCON YES 1000 NORPAK SU1624 42.79 APPCO
114 | H113 NN-FOOD 45 PAN LINERS, 22X16X58 BLACK HEAVY POLY SPECIFY SPECIFY YES 100 XL PG66050 36.53 APPCO




DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES BID #2324-02 - NON FOOD BID ITEMS
AWARD SHEET - TERM: JULY 13, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024

PROJECTED PRODUCT MEETS
1 USAGE 2023- BUY AMERICAN
2024 UNIT OF PREFERRED | PROVISION (YES AWARDED
ITEM #| CATEGORY DESCRIPTION MEASURE BRAND OR NO) uom BRAND BID STOCK # PRICE PER UOM VENDOR
15| Hua | 13 PAN LINERS, 23X17X46 CLEAR HEAVY POLY SPECIFY SPECIFY YES 100 XL PG14650 19.97 APPCO
116 | H115 5 PAN LINERS, HOT HOLDING FOR STEAM TABLE FULL SIZE NO 50/CS FOODHANDLER | ISL22PL3418 30.11 HILL & MARKES
NN-FOOD HOTEL PANS 50/CS FOODHANDLER
117 | H116 12 PAN LINERS, HOT HOLDING FOR STEAM TABLE 1/2 SIZE YES 100 HFA PCA6132 19.29 APPCO
NN-FOOD HOTEL PANS 100/CS FOODHANDLER
PLATES - PAPER, ECO FORWARD - 6", MOISTURE, CUT &
118 | H117 | NN-FOOD 7 GREASE RESISTANT, MICROWAVE SAFE, COMPOSTABLE, SFI 1000/CS soLo NO 1000 CHINET KE21225 58.29 APPCO
CERTIFIED (MFR #MP6J8001PK)
PLATES - PAPER, HEAVY WEIGHT - 9", MOISTURE, CUT &
119 | H118 | NN-FOOD 5 GREASE RESISTANT, MICROWAVE SAFE, COMPOSTABLE, SFI 500/CS SOLO NO 1000 SUNSHINE SWDBFOWSP 50.79 APPCO
CERTIFIED (MFR #HP92-18001)
120 | H119 | NN-FOOD 50 PLATES - PAPER (HEAVY WEIGHT, PLASTIC COATED) 8 1/2"" 500/CS ASPEN NO 1000 SUNSHINE SWDBFOWSP 50.79 APPCO
121 | H120 | NN-FOOD 175 PLATES - PAPER (UNCOATED) 6", 100% COMPOSTABLE 1000/CS GREENWAVE NO 1000/CS GREENWAVE | GRNPFEVP0O6 56.43 HILL & MARKES
122 | H121 | NN-FOOD 50 PLATES, PAPER (UNCOATED) 9", 100% COMPOSTABLE 500/CS GREENWAVE NO 500 CHINET PCA41 41.39 APPCO
123 | H122 | NN-FOOD 40 PLATES, PLASTIC, 9", WHITE, ROUND, DART MFR #9PWFPK 500/PK DART OR EQUAL NO 400 PRC NY241 19.97 APPCO
124 | H123 | NN-FOOD 0 POT HOLDERS, OVEN MITTS - FLAMEGARD 1 EACH ADMIRAL CRAFT NO 1/EA ADMIRAL CRAFT | ADM11MFG13 5.87 HILL & MARKES
125 | H124 | NN-FOOD 0 POT HOLDER, 8" - FLAMEGUARD 1 EACH ADMIRAL CRAFT NO 1/EA ADMIRAL CRAFT | ADM11PHFG8 3.64 HILL & MARKES
126 | H125 | NN-FOOD 1 RINSE AID - JET DRY HIGH-TEMP DISHWASHING ADDITIVE 4/1 GAL/CS ECOLAB YES 4/1GL/CS ECOLAB EC06113722 153.21 HILL & MARKES
RINSE, DRY SPOTLESS #14K FOR DISPENSING MACHINE
127 | H126 | NN-FOOD 10 ’ ’ 4 GAL/CS INTEGRA No Bid No Bid
MFR #PKI3540
RINSE, HIGH TEMP DRYING, #4, FOR CONQUER DISPENSER CONQUER
128 | H127 | NN-FOOD 1 ’ P Q | a/16AL/cs QUER/ No Bid No Bid
MFR #PKI3500 INTEGRA




DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES BID #2324-02 - NON FOOD BID ITEMS
AWARD SHEET - TERM: JULY 13, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024

PROJECTED PRODUCT MEETS
1 USAGE 2023- BUY AMERICAN
2024 UNIT OF PREFERRED | PROVISION (YES AWARDED
ITEM #| CATEGORY DESCRIPTION MEASURE BRAND OR NO) uom BRAND BID STOCK # PRICE PER UOM VENDOR
SANITIZER, LIQUID, NO-RINSE QUAT, FOR DISPENSER, 4 4
H128 | NN-FOOD 4GAL
129 8 00 ! BARRIER II, BARRIER #21, MFR #PKI3581 GAL/CS INTEGRA ONLY No Bid No Bid
SANITIZER, QUAT (QUATERNARY AMMONIUM) TEST STRIPS ECOLAB OR
H129 | NN-FOOD 100 STRIPS/VIAL E 100/RL ECOLAB EC092642 14.4 HILL E
130 0 FOR FOOD SERVICE 00 STRIPS/’ FQUAL YES 00/ COLA 0092642530 4 & MARKES
SANITIZER TEST STRIPS, QUATERNARY IODINE SANITIZER ‘ ‘
H130 | NN-FOOD
131 | H130 00 TEST STRIPS, 100/PACK. FMP 142.1361 100 STRIPS/PK FMP No Bid No Bid
SANITIZER TABLETS, 1 TABLET/GALLON, 150
132 | H131 | NN-FOOD 0 ' / g 6/100 600/CS GLISSEN YES 6/100 EPIC EPST 46.39 APPCO
TABLETS/BOTTLE
133 | H132 1 YES 60 DISCO PUNSP 18.87 APPCO
NN-FOOD SCRUBBER PADS, NYLON GREEN 6/10 DISCO OR EQUAL
134 | H133 | NN-FOOD 1 SCRUBBER STAINLESS STEEL 6/12 CT/CS ROYAL NO 6/12 DISCO PUSOS 24.63 APPCO
135 | H134 | NN-FOOD 0 SCRUBBER, STEEL WITH SOAP 120/Cs DISCO YES 12/10/Cs DISCO DSCSP1210 33.01 HILL & MARKES
STEAM TABLE PANS, ALUMINUM- 1/2 SIZE, 2 9/16" DEEP
136 | H135 | NN-FOOD 13 b /25128, 29/ g 100/Cs PACTIV YES 100 PACTIV PCA6132 19.29 APPCO
MFR. #PCA-6132-XH
137 | H136 | NN-FOOD 15 LID TO FIT 1/2 SIZE STEAM TABLE PAN, MFR #PCA-1012-30 100/Cs PACTIV YES 100 PACTIV PCA1012 18.43 APPCO
STEAM TABLE PANS, ALUMINUM-FULL SIZE, 4" DEEP, MFR
138 | H137 | NN-FOOD 1 b b g 50/CS PACTIV YES 50 PACTIV PCA6050 47.67 APPCO
#PCA-6050XH
139 | H138 | NN-FOOD 2 LID TO FIT FULL SIZE STEAM TABLE PAN, MFR #PCA-1120-45 50/CS PACTIV YES 50 PACTIV PCA1120 19.49 APPCO
140 | H139 | NN-FOOD 1 STIRRER STICKS, 5", SOLID, BPA FREE 1000/CS | COMPFY OR EQUAL NO 10/1000 PRC REPS 8.99 APPCO
STRAWS, SINGLE WRAP - JUMBO %" DIAMETER, 5-3/4"
141 | H140 | NN-FOOD 21 TonG : / 12000/CS NP&PC NO 24/500/CS NP&PC NPP420332 52.37 HILL & MARKES
STRAWS, 7.75" CLEAR, SINGLE WRAP
H141 | NN-FOOD 24/400/Cs | ECO-PRODUCT: N 24/4 E RE 7 APP
142 0 STRAW,COMPOSTABLE /400/ CO-PRODUCTS [e} /400 co cs 68.79 co
TABLE COVER, 54"X108", PLASTIC, (SPECIFY COLORS) NAVY CREATIVE CNVO01255
143 | H142 | NN-FOOD 27 ' ' A ) 6/PK CONVERTING YES 12/Cs 21.28 HILL & MARKES
BLUE; WHITE, ORANGE REQUESTED, MFR #CO54108P__ COVERING FWHITE*
144 | H143 | NN-FOOD 10 TAPE, CASH REGISTER 44MM 10/10 CT/CS NATIONAL YES 5/10/CS NATIONAL NCC1441130SP 26.13 HILL & MARKES
’ CHECKING CHECKING :




DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES BID #2324-02 - NON FOOD BID ITEMS
AWARD SHEET - TERM: JULY 13, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024

PROJECTED PRODUCT MEETS
1 USAGE 2023- BUY AMERICAN
2024 UNIT OF PREFERRED | PROVISION (YES AWARDED
ITEM #| CATEGORY DESCRIPTION MEASURE BRAND OR NO) uom BRAND BID STOCK # PRICE PER UOM VENDOR
THERMOMETER, OVEN/WARMER 50 TO 500 DEG F, 1/2"
145 [ H144 30 DIAMETER, 2 INCH DIAL, 4 1/2" LONG, NSF & HACCP ADMIRAL CRAFT No Bid No Bid
NN-FOOD CERTIFIED 2 PACK OR EQUAL
THERMOMETER, POCKET TEST, 0 TO 220 DEG F, 1 INCH
PLASTIC DIAL, 5 1/2" LONG, BI-THERMAL, STAINLESS STEEL
146 | H145 | NN-FOOD 3 51/ ’ ’ 1EACH ADMIRAL CRAFT NO 1/EA ADMIRAL CRAFT ADMPT1 7.60 HILL & MARKES
PEN-STYLE CASE WITH POCKET CLIP, NSF & HACCP
CERTIFIED (MFR #PT-1)
147 | H146 50 THERMOMETER, POCKET TEST, 1" DIAL, TAYLOR MFG. NO 1/EA TAYLOR DOT694013 3.72 HILL & MARKES
NN-FOOD PREFERRED, MFR #694013 1EA TAYLOR
THERMOMETER, REFRIGERATOR/FREEZER, -20 TO 80 DEG F,
148 | H147 | NN-FOOD 3 PLASTIC CASE 1/2" DIAMETER, 2 INCH DIAL, 4 1/2" LONG, 2 PACK ADMIRAL CRAFT NO 2PK ADMIRAL CRAFT ADMRFT1 7.10 HILL & MARKES
NSF & HACCP CERTIFIED (MFR #RFT-1)
149 | H148 | NN-FOOD 7 TISSUE, FACIAL, WHITE, 2PLY, 30 BX/100 CT/CASE 3000/CS CASCADES YES 30/100 PLASTIRUN FHFT 19.79 APPCO
CHICOPEE OR
150 | H149 | NN-FOOD 265 TOWEL, CHIX, PINK WET WIPES 13.5"X24" 200/CS EQUAL YES 200/CS CHICOPEE CHX8507 17.26 HILL & MARKES
CHICOPEE OR
151 | H150 | NN-FOOD 24 TOWEL, CHIX, 17X17 WORXWELL, 100/CS 100/CS EQUAL YES 100/CS CHICOPEE CHX8482 38.41 HILL & MARKES
TRAY, 5 COMPARTMENT, COMPOSTABLE, NATURAL
H151 | NN-FOOD 1441 ’ ’ ’ 500/CS PACTIV OR EQUAL YE 24 HINET KEFLASH24 21. PP
152 0 MOLDED FIBER, 10.24"X8.25"X1.25" - MFR #MC58000S / CTIVOR EQUA S 0 ¢ ASH240 % APPCO
TRAY, 5 COMPARTMENT, COMPOSTABLE, WHITE, GENPAK OR
H152 | NN-FOOD .
153 5 00 0 8.4"X10.25". FIGER, GENPAC MER #HFL05 500/CS EQUAL NO 500/CS NP&PC NPP02059 53.91 HILL & MARKES
TRAYS, FOOD BASKETS, 8 0Z, COATED PAPER, RED PLAID
H153 | NN-FOOD 212 ' o e ’ ’ 1000/CS P OR EQUAL YE 42 P P87 19.94 HILL & MARKE
154 SQP MFR #8708 "PAPER BOATS" / SQP OR EQUA S /250/C5 sa SQpe708 9.9 & S
TRAYS, FOOD, 1 LB, COATED PAPER, RED PLAID, SQP MFR
H154 | NN-FOOD 221 1000/CS P OR EQUAL YE 42 P P18701 23. HILL & MARKE
155 #1870, "PAPER BOATS” / SQP OR EQU s /250/CS sQ sQP1870 3.33 & S
TRAYS, FOOD, 2 LB, COATED PAPER, RED PLAID, SQP MFR
H155 | NN-FOOD 1000/CS P OR EQUAL YE 1 P P8702 28.22 HILL & MARKE
156 35 #5702, "PAPER BOATS" / SQP OR EQUAI S 000/CS sQ SQP870; 8 & MARKES
TRAYS, FOOD, 3 LB, COATED PAPER, RED PLAID, SQP MFR
157 | H156 | NN-FOOD 46 ’ e ’ »SQ 500/CS SQP OR EQUAL YES 500 sap FO300 22.85 APPCO

#8703, "PAPER BOATS"
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES BID #2324-02 - NON FOOD BID ITEMS
AWARD SHEET - TERM: JULY 13, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024

PROJECTED PRODUCT MEETS
1 USAGE 2023- BUY AMERICAN
2024 UNIT OF PREFERRED | PROVISION (YES AWARDED
ITEM #| CATEGORY DESCRIPTION MEASURE BRAND OR NO) uom BRAND BID STOCK # PRICE PER UOM VENDOR
158 | H157 | NN-FOOD 60 TRAYS, FOOD, 5 LB, COATED PAPER, SQP MFR #8705 500/CS SQP OR EQUAL YES 500 sqp FO500 22.99 APPCO
TRAY, NACHO, CLEAR, PAC PLASTIC, 2 COMPARTMENT
159 | H158 | NN-FOOD 95 » NACHO, CLEAR, PAC PLASTIC, 2 CO 500/CS DART OR EQUAL YES 500 DART SWNTK56 49.79 APPCO
(DART #C68NT2)
WAREWASH DETERGENT, CONQUER ALL TEMP, HEAVY
160 | H159 | NN-FOOD 14 DUTY, LIQUID #4, CONTROLS CALCIUM, MAGNESIUM, IRON 4GAL/CS INTEGRA YES 4/1GL/CS BETCO BTC2447400 58.65 HILL & MARKES
& OTHER MINERAL DEPOSITS
WICK LIQUID CHAFING FUEL, POWER PAD SAFE HEAT,
161 | H160 | NN-FOOD 102 DIETHYLENE GLYCOL, 2 HR BURN TIME, STERNO MFR 72/Cs STERNO NO 24/Cs PICO HOSPITALITY PICST200 36.91 HILL & MARKES
#10112
WIPES, CLOROX CS DISINFECTING WIPES-FRESH SCENT,
H161 | NN-FOOD 117 6/75 CT/CS LOROX YE 7 LYSoL BO5834 14. APP
162 BLEACH & ALCOHOL FREE, KILLS 99.9% /75 CT/ CLORO S &/75 >0 0583 i o
WRAP - ALUMINUM FOIL - 18" 500 FT. - 1 ROLL, 0. -
163 | H162 | NN-FOOD 18 UMINUM FOIL - 18" 500 OLL, 0.00063 1ROLL WESTERN YES 1 PRC K1318 16.99 APPCO
0.00072 MIL
BAGCRAFT OR
164 | H163 | NN-FOOD 0 WRAP-DELI WRAP-COMPOSTABLE, 9"X12" 6000/CS FQUAL YES 6000 NORPAK NI912 88.73 APPCO
WRAP-DELI WRAP - INTERFOLDED 12" X 10 3/4", DURABLE
165 | H164 | NN-FOOD 6 /4% 12/500 DURABLE YES 12/500 NORPAK NOMAW 39.79 APPCO
PACKAGING SW-12 OR EQUAL
166 | H165 | NN-FOOD 68 WRAP - FILM, VINYL WRAP, 18"'x2000' W/SLIDE CUTTER 1ROLL WESTERN YES 1 WESTERN BO182000 16.93 APPCO
WRAP - FILM , VINYL WRAP, 12 X 2,000 ROLL W/SLIDE
167 | H166 | NN-FOOD 55 CUTTER ’ ’ ’ / 1ROLL WESTERN YES 1 WESTERN 80122000 11.99 APPCO
DART/SOLO
168 | H167 | NN-FOOD 6 BOWL - SOUP 1207, HOT/COLD, PAPER, SQUAT ONLY 500/CS JCHINET NO 500 SUNSHINE GFC10W 54.94 APPCO
WRAP, 10.5"X14" GOLD CHECK FOIL/PAPER HONEYCOMB
H168 20 4/500/CS BAGCRAFT YES 5/500 VOLFLEX BAS28 129.63 APPCO
e INSULATED (BAGCRAFT MFR #300816) /500/ /
NN-FOOD
WRAP, 10.5"X14" RED CHECK FOIL /PAPER HONEYCOMB
H169 2 4/500/CS BAGCRAFT YE VOLFLEX BAS27 129. PP
170 NN-FOOD 0 INSULATED(BAGCRAFT MFR #300842) /500/ AGCRA S 5/500 0 8 9.63 APPCO
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES BID #2324-02 - NON FOOD BID ITEMS

AWARD SHEET - TERM: JULY 13, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024

PROJECTED PRODUCT MEETS
1 USAGE 2023- BUY AMERICAN
2024 UNIT OF PREFERRED | PROVISION (YES AWARDED
ITEM #| CATEGORY DESCRIPTION MEASURE BRAND ORNO) uom BRAND BID STOCK # PRICE PER UOM VENDOR
WRAP, 10.5"X14" BLUE CHECK FOIL/PAPER HONEYCOMB
H170 14 4/500/Cs BAGCRAFT YES 5/500 VOLFLEX BA829 129.63 APPCO
71 INSULATED (BAGCRAFT MFR #300844) /500/ /
NN-FOOD
WRAP - CUSHION-FOLD SANDWICH WRAP SHEETS, 14"X16",
172 | H171 | NN-FoOD 113 SILVER, INSULATED FOIL/PAPER SANDWICH WRAP SHEETS, | 1000 CT/CS REYNOLDS YES 1000 VOLFLEX BA841 48.97 APPCO
FOR HOT OR COLD FOOD
173 | H172 | NN-FoOD 50 WRAP - FOIL SHEETS 12"X10 3/4" 3000CT/CS | PRC OR EQUAL NO 2400 PRC K1370 48.87 APPCO
174 | H173 | NN-FOOD 24 WRAP - FOIL SHEETS 9"'x10 3/4" 6/500 CT/CS | PRC OR EQUAL NO 3000 PRC K71 56.33 APPCO
WRAP - ALUMINUM FOIL - 18" 500 FT. - 1 ROLL, Heavy Dut
175 | H174 | NN-FOOD 14 »rieavy Duty 1ROLL REYNOLDS NO 1 PRC K1328 19.99 APPCO

Weight, MFR #624
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