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TO: Jodi DeLucia, Ph.D., District Superintendent

FROM: Mike Skerritt, Assistant Superintendent for Business & Operations m’
DATE: April 16, 2026 ‘

RE: Extension of Cooperative Fresh Baked Bread & Bread Products

REB #2425-02 Ext. #2

I recommend the approval of the extension of the bid award to Rockland Bakery, Inc., of
Nanuet, NY, and Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc., of McDonough, GA for Cooperative Fresh
Baked Bread & Bread Products RFB #2425-02 Ext. #2.

The contract extension period is from July 1, 2026 through June 30, 2027.

APPROVED

MAY 1 3 2026

DUTCHESS BOCES
BOARD OF EDUCATION

MS/tf
Attachment

Dutchess BOCES, 5 BOCES Road, Poughkeepsie, NY 12601 | 845.486.4800 | www.dcboces.org

Participating districts: Arlington | Beacon | Dover | Hyde Park | Millbrook | Pawling | Pine Plains | Poughkeepsie | Red Hook | Rhinebeck | Spackenkill | Wappingers | Webutuck

An Equal Opportunity/Affirmative Action Employer
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DUTCHESS COUNTY BOCES BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES
5 BOCES Road
Poughkeepsie, NY 12601

COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD & BREAD PRODUCTS BID #2425-02 -

Extension #2
Current Extension: July 1, 2026 through June 30, 2027
Original Contract Period: July 1, 2024 through June 30, 2025
(with the Option to Extend Up to Three (3 One-Year Extensions)

The undersigned agrees to supply the service and products described within that has been hid
pursuant to the terms of the bid and the terms of the "Special Instructions to Bidders and
General Conditions of the Contract" which are incorporated as part of the original bid
document by reference to them on this cover sheet.

Company
Name:

Rot\ound  Bowees IAC-

Name of
Contact: o .
BTG 6 OXTGANIG
Address:
04 Demousrzst wiw Rd .
Nonoerx  n 10O%54
Telephone:
¥uS W13 %00
Fax Number:
Email: -
LABING (% ¢ SUANAD Mty Lonn
Signature:

AiTe . 75 ﬁ/\f/’t{;?}i/f/;f\,

Date: H/15/ 2000




DUTCHESS COUNTY BOCES BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES
5 BOCES Road
Poughkeepsie, NY 12601

COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD & BREAD PRODUCTS BID #2425-02 —

Extension #2
Current Extension: July 1, 2026 through June 30, 2027
Original Contract Period: July 1, 2024 through June 30, 2025
(with the Option to Extend Up to Three (3 One-Year Extensions)

The undersigned agrees to supply the service and products described within that has been bid
pursuant to the terms of the bid and the terms of the "Special Instructions to Bidders and
General Conditions of the Contract" which are incorporated as part of the original bid
document by reference to them on this cover sheet.

Company

Name:  mibo Bakeries USA, Inc.

Name of

Contact:
Angela Bell -Bid Coordinator

Address:
800 N. King Street, Suite 304 #2516

Wilmington, DE 19801

Telephone:
404-623-8975

Fax Number:

Email:
BBUFSBids@grupobimbo.com - angela.bell@grupobimbo.com

Signature: A e Bol

Date:  2/3/2026
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SLICE COUNT.

DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD BID #2425-02 Ext. #2

BID ITEMS - TERM: JULY 1, 2026 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2027

[[WOTE: Bid ltems I-18 must De at east 517 Whole Grain. The remaimder of
grains must be enriched. SLICED BREAD - DO NOT COUNT ENDS IN USABLE

VENDOR NAME:
Rockland Bakery, Inc.

VENDOR NAME:
Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.

*Bimbo will only provide to: DC Boces, Pine Plains CSD,
Poughkeepsie City SD, Spackenkill UFSD

;:—;r‘;lt::'.r MEETS BUY MEAS‘HUIREIB'D MEETS BUY UNIT OF
BIDITEM | o ecrep | DESCRIPTION - All Products Must | UNIT OF MEASURE AMERICAN i mFFERENT' VENDOR CRICEPER DG AMERICAN  |MEASURE BID, IF|  VENDOR PRICE hER LM
# | LsaGE 2024] MeetUSDA Grain Requirements (uom) PROVISION (vEs | = = o CATALOG # PROVISION (YES |  DIFFERENT CATALOG #
S ORNO) e ORNO) FROM BID SPEC.
BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT
1 0 2 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MINI, SLICED, 1.8 OZ/EA 12/PACK
BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT,
2 638 g ‘ YES 1462-02 : NO BID
SLICED, 2.4 OZ/EA (HS/MS ONLY) 12/PACK o i
B E H
3 277 S:?ﬂ'f’; 5;;;:: (S;Eoi':)'” HRHETS YES 0173-02 5.40 NO BID
: 12/PACK
BREAD, CRACKED WHEAT, 1.3 0z LOAF - 16 Useable
. NEW b o1iCE, MIN. 51% WHOLE GRAIN Slices/LOAF YES NOBID NO BID NO BID
BREAD, HEARTY FLAXSEED, 1.3 0Z LOAF - 16 Useable
5 NEW YES NO B N NO BID
SLICE, MIN. 51% WHOLE GRAIN Slices/LOAF QD CBID
BREAD, OAT BRAN, 1.3 OZ SLICE, LOAF - 16 Useable
6 NEW y YES NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIN. 51% WHOLE GRAIN Slices/LOAF
BREAD, STUB -100% WHOLE GRAIN
7 4994  |WHEAT- 1 0Z/SLICE CREDITING 10Z | LOAF - 22 Useable NO BID NO BID YES 6377 2.55
GR EQ/SLICE Slices/LOAF
BREAD, WHOLE GRAIN WHITE, 1
8 4808  |0Z/SLICE CREDITING 1oz GR LOAF - 20 Useable YES 26 USABLE 0244-01 2.30 YES 3239 2.50
EQ/SLICE Slices/LOAF
BREAD, FRENCH BREAD, 51% WHOLE
9 178 : d YES 1409-01 1.85 NO BID
WHEAT, 15 OZ LOAF LOAF
CLUB ROLL, 51% WHOLE WHEAT,
10 702 : : YES 1410-02 3.76 NO BID
SLICED, 4", 2.4 OZ/EA (HS/MS ONLY) 12/PACK
CLUB ROLL, 51% WHOLE WHEAT,
11 988 g i YES 1433-02 3.88 YES 6ct - 202 6375 2.10
SLICED, 6", 3 OZ/EA (HS ONLY) 12/PACK
4 KET
- new  |ROLL DINNER, MIN. 51% CRACKED S Hbih ST
WHEAT, 1.8 OZ/EA. 10/PACK
ROLL, DINNER, 51% WHEAT
13 120 ’ A ! NO BID NO BID YES 12ct 5397 2.16
BREAKAWAY, 1.17 OZ/EA 12/PACK
ROLL, DINNER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN
4 4836 YES : NO BID
¥ " WHEAT, 1.5 0Z/EA 12/PACK ke Lee0.01 Rl
ROLL, HAMBURGER, 51% WHOLE 100% Whole
15 12,746 |GRAIN WHEAT, SLICED, 2.15 OZ/EA YES 1485-01 2.20 YES Wheat - 5392 4,08
CREDITING 2.00 0Z GR EQ/SLICE 2.190z ea 2greq
12/PACK
- — ROLL, HAMBURGER, 51% WHOLE A B e
WHEAT, SLICED, 2 0Z/EA
16/PACK
ROLL, HOT DOG, 51% WHOLE GRAIN 100% Whole
17 1900  [WHEAT, 2.15 0Z/EA CREDITING 2.00 YES 1486-01 2.20 YES Wheat - 5393 4.08
0Z GR EQ/SLICE 2.190z ea 2gr eq
12/PACK




DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD BID #2425-02 Ext. #2

BID ITEMS - TERM: JULY 1, 2026 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2027

SCHOOL NIT OF
DISTRICT MEETS BUY ME:SU‘I;E BID MEETS BUY UNIT OF
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION - All Products Must AMERICAN K VENDOR AMERICAN  |MEASURE BID, IF VENDOR
R IF DIFFERENT PRICE PER UOM 4
# :g:’éic::: 4 Meet USDA Grain Requirements UNITOF MEASURE | o svision (YES [Resieas CATALOG # PROVISION (YES |  DIFFERENT CATALOG # RIUCERERLOM
e OR NO) ni ORNO) FROM BID SPEC.
P
18 0 ROLL DR DO, SUSWHDES NO BID NO BID NO BID
WHEAT, 2 OZ/EA
16/PACK
ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN
1 1850 ’ ! YES 1407-02 3.64 NO BID
. WHEAT, SLICED, 1.8 OZ/EA 12/PACK
ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN, 4" S T
6
2 f , It : .
20 304 DIAM, SLICED, 2 OZ/EA YES each) See Item 3.72 3242 312
12/PACK 22 below.
ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE WHEAT,
¥ : ‘ Y 1405-02 3.72 N
# 2674 ¢\ \cep, 2.4 07/EA (HS/MS ONLY) 12/PACK £ o8p
ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE WHEAT,
2 154 [SLICED, 3.5 OZ/EA [HS ONLY); YES 1431.02 3.88 NO BID
CREDITING AS 3.00 OZ GR EQ/EA 12/PACK
THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE NOT_
WHOLE GRAIN
23 0 Bagel Sticks 144/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID
BAGELS, 4 0Z, ASSORTED, SLICED,
4 IO ! ’ YES 0125-01 HN/A NO BID
2 i (NOT WG) 12/PACK /i
BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, CINNAMON RAISIN,
! d ! NO BID NO BID
= s SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK LB
BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, PLAIN, SLICED (NOT
26 182 we) 12/PACK YES 0342-02 #N/A NO BID
BAGELS, 2.4 0Z, POPPY, SLICED (NOT
27 0 W) 12/pACK NO BID NOBID NO BID
BAGELS, 2.4 0Z, SESAME, SLICED
: g g NO BI NO BID NO BI
28 0 (NOT WG) 12/PACK 0 BID [o}:] O BID
BAGELS, 4 0Z, CINNAMON RAISIN,
X 3 |
29 13 | e morwe) 12/PACK YES 0175-02 5.40 NO BID
BAGELS, 4 0Z, EVERYTHING, SLICED
-0 4
30 146 (NOT WG) . YES 0172-02 5.40 NO BID
BAGELS, 4 0Z., MARBLE, SLICED (NOT
31 6 W) 12/PACK YES 0345-02 5.40 NO BID
BAGELS, 4 0Z, PLAIN, SLICED (NOT
-02 .40 NO BID
32 2125 WG) 12/PACK YES 0165 5
% 264 |BAGELS, 4 0Z, SESAME, SLICED (NOT e ey e S
WG) 12/PACK :
34 10542 BREAD, FRENCH STYLE SOLEA YES 0108-01 1.85 NO BID




DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD BID #2425-02 Ext. #2

BID ITEMS - TERM: JULY 1, 2026 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2027

sg‘:;% MEETS BUY MEL;SN&::!D MEETS BUY UNIT OF
BIDITEM | o ecrep | PESCRIPTION - All Products Must | UNIT OF MEASURE AMERICAN |- DIFFERENT' VENDOR BRICEBER DM AMERICAN | MEASURE BID, IF VENDOR PR CERER O
# | JsaGE 2024] MeetUSDA Grain Requirements (uom) PROVISION (YES | "0 oo CATALOG # PROVISION (YES |  DIFFERENT CATALOG #
s OR NO) o ORNO) FROM BID SPEC.
THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE NOT
WHOLE GRAIN

CLUB ROLL, 4" SOFT CRUST, SLICED
35 0 {NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 0 CLUB ROLL, 6", SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID NO BID

HARD ROLLS, KAISER, 3.5 0Z, ONION
37 0 (NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID NO BID

HARD ROLLS, KAISER, 3.5 OZ, PLAIN
38 88 |orwe) SRR YES 0402-02 3.88
39 48 MINI DANISH EA YES 0499-01 10.84
40 1902 [DANISH ASSORTED EA YES 0844-01 16.22
a1 3¢ |MUEFINS, MINI ASSORTED 12/PACK YES 0490-01 10.20
42 180 |MUFFINS, LARGE ASSORTED 12/PACK YES 0844-01 16.22
43 14 DONUTS, LARGE ASSORTED 12/PACK YES 0593-01 10.32
44 0 PASTRY, LARGE ASSORTED 12/PACK NO BID NO BID




