)Z12_

putcHEssB@CES

Innovation | Partnership | Growth
Jodi DeLucia

District Superintendent

Michael Skerritt

Assistant Superintendent for Business & Operations
845.486.4800 Ext. 2227 | michael.skerritt@dcboces.org

TO:
FROM:
DATE:
RE:

Jodi DeLucia, Ph.D., District Superintendent

Mike Skerritt, Assistant Superintendent for Business & Operations % g
February 26, 2026

Dutchess BOCES Print Shop Supplies RFB #2526-30

[ recommend the acceptance of the bid offers from the following vendors for Dutchess BOCES
Print Shop Supplies RFB #2526-30, as detailed on the attached award sheets:

Lindenmeyr Munroe of Latham, NY
Mark Andy of Chesterfield, MO
Quill of Lincolnshire, IL

Staples of Philadelphia, PA

W.B. Mason of Newburgh, NY

The contract period is from March 12, 2026 through March 11, 2027 with the option to extend
for four (4) additional one-year terms.

MS/Af

Attachments

APPROVED

MAR 11 2026

DUTCHESS BOCES
BOARD OF EDUCATION

Dutchess BOCES, 5 BOCES Road, Poughkeepsie, NY 12601 | 845.486.4800 | www.dcboces.org

Participating districts: Arlington | Beacon | Dover | Hyde Park | Millbrook | Pawling | Pine Plains | Poughkeepsie | Red Hook | Rhinebeck

| Spackenkill | Wappingers | Webutuck

An Equal Opportunity/Affirmative Action Employer
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DUTCHESS BOCES PRINT SHOP SUPPLIES BID #2526-30
Contract Period: March 12, 2026 through March 11, 2027

wi/ four optional one-year extensions

Lindenmeyr Munroe Quill Staples WB Mason
Secondary Award
At 100cns | 11x17 28770 | Opaque Text Smocth Finish White Accent 2000/ctn Accont 108405 $ 90.00 NO BIO Hammenmdl'Sytvamal 479326 B Q2 WH Lason inginingi hwas
A2 Wens | 11x17 cdsie 2870 | Opsque Text Smooth Finish Warm White Accent 20007t NO BID Muos. e
A3 Sars | 1x22 60 | Brite White Uncosted Offset Crack & Peel Uindenmeyr 500/ctn NO BID Lindenmeyr Munroe A
A4 | 0cns | e5x1t 20 | Pre-porfed 5™ from le side white (#128830) Pars 2500ctn NO BID latimpresca 13130080 s A0 | | indenmeyr Munios: WE Mason
BRIGHTS o
AS Tsans | BEx1 24/60 | AstroBrights Text - various colors Neanah 5000ictn | Astrobrights Various s 16500 | ASTROBRIGHT chod Golor List noenah waLZaxEx s 121.60 Staples WEB Mason
4 e
A6 | Soctns | 11x17 24/60 | AstroBrights Text - various calors Neenah 2500ictn | Astrobrights Various (] 16500 | ASTROBRIGHT | attached Color List neenah wauZoo s 12160 5
fo Stocs 84 D0 taples WE Masan
'COLOR COPIER
AT s | TxN 281105 | Color Copy Paper Photowhite. Mahawk 2000/ctn NO BID Lindes Monros: WA
a8 | 25ams | asxn 2870 | Color Copy Paper Photownite Hammarmil 4000/cn | Hammemmil 102467 s 11500 NO BID Stogios s e
A9 ans | 1x17 2870 | Color Copy Paper Photowhite: Hammermdl 2000ctn NO BID Lindenmeyr Munroe. WA
A1 Sans | 18212 80 | Color Copy Pure White Gioss. Mohawe 1500fcn NO BD Lindanrneyr Munrop Stapies
A | 10aw | 2xis 80 | Gloss Digeal Text whae Sapp 1250/cn NO BID Classic CrestiNeenat] 194703 69323 Lindenmeyr Muiios
A12 25ans | 8B5x 11 24 | Atss Bond Light Cocide Finish White Atlas. 5000/ctn Capital BE22 £ 245.00 NO BID WE Mason Lindorsneys Munros
A3 | 220ctns | T1x17 20/50 | WP Gopy Paper - White 52 Brighiness FascopyMil Equal 2500/ctn Domtar 3973 3 62.00 auiLL T201117CT 555 50 masen wbm28110 5 36.60 Staples Lindonmey Munios
M4 | 10cns | 85k14 20/50 | MP Gopy Paper - White 82 Brighiness Fascopy/Mil Equal | 5000ictn | Hammermil 10501-5 B 99.00 QuILL 720223CT 57156 mason wbm24200 s 49.80 Siadiai i T
AYS | Bavcins | 85x11 20050 | MP Copy Paper - White 82 Brightness Fascopy™il Equal 5000/ctn New Future 583 $ 38.00 auiL T20222CT $4399 masen wom21200 5 nn Staples. Lindenmayr Muniog
- Fleass se8
A6 | 110cmns | 85xn 2050 | Fore MP Copy Paper - Various Colors. Hammermal soctictn | Hammermsil various 3 80.00 QuiL Sl mason womzz20tx | § B0 Staples L Munice
M7 20ctns | B5x14 20750 | Fore MP Copy Paper - Various Colors Hammermill 5000/etn Hammermill varous $ 114.00 NOBID B48468 $ 110.00 WH Masan Staples
a8 | sacns | 11x1T 2050 | Fore MP Copy Paper - Venous Colors Hammarmil 2500/ctn | Hammermil varous 5 a1.00 ~OBID hammermil hamio2ox | § 7980 WE Mascn
I e 85 | Opeque Cover Smooth Firish Write Accent 1250/ctn NOBID Staples 620702 s 7000 accent hmen183570pk | § L] T — WE Aason
A0 | 1waes | nx1z 80 | Opaque Cover Super Smooth Fnish White Accent 1000/t NOBID PR T eers WA
DRIGHTS
A | wans | 11x17 65 | Aswolnghts Caver - varous colors Mohawe 1000/ctn | Astrobrights various s 155.00 NO BID WB Mason Lindenmayr Murvos
COLORCOPYC OVER
A22 15ctns | 18x12 B0 | Color Copy Cover Photowhite Hammermil 1000/ctn Hammermill 133200 5 138.00 NOBID WH Mason Lindermeyr Munros
A2 | t5ans | 17x11 80 | Color Copy Caver Photowhite Hammermil 1000/ctn | Hammermil 12003-7 s 126.00 NOBID Cougar/Domitar 185491 $ 206.40 WB Mason L [Py
Az4 teatns | 17x11 100 | Celar Copy Cover Photowhite Hammermill 750/ctn Hammormill 133202 3 139.00 NO BID LUXBig Name Commeq 2146868 3 209.10 WH Mason i Munras
A5 Scins | 85x11 110 | Classic Crest Smooth Cover - Solar White Neansh 1500/ctn Neenah 4456, S 300.25 NO BID Staples 490887 $ 5148 WB Masen T ——
Springhill Index - White -
A28 Vom | 17 x11grain 11 50 | (FulStze 2012 x 244" o 17°x 117 2out- st | "WMAAPI | yoggic | sprngt NA s 3000 NomiR
be ream wrapoed) Stagles L Munros
Soringnil Index - Vancus Calors -
a? 70m | 17x11grain 11 90 | (Full Sze 22172 x 35 @0 17" x 11°- 3 out - Must ba '"“"“mp'“' 500/ctn NG BID
ream Lindenmeyr Munros A
A28 | Gems | 225x35gan3s | 110 | Springnil incex - whte - o s00'ctn NOBID St =
= Triematonal Paper
A28 4ctns | 225%35gain35 | 110 | Soringhil Index - Various Colors - oLy 500ctn NOBID T e At Wk
Tntamatonal Paper
A3 Scns | 26x38 grain 38 150 | Springni Ingex - vinae - e sovictn NOBD [TrrRa—— WA
s Iniernatonal Paper
A3t 2ctns | 225x35grain 35 140 | Springhill Index - Various Colors - oy 500/ctn NOBID NOBID NOBID NGB
A32 | 20 bundies| 11x17 Chipboard 375kctn NOBID Unbranded 462636 $ 8002 Linarsmonr oo 5
6-34 regular SECURITY, diagonal seam, whila wove, Rrnaie: Gl
A3 | seins | 3825x65 wh2e | Printmaster ONLY | 5000%etn O BID Staples 373z $ St U g7 Munroe Staplos
£-5/8 SECURITY standard window, diagonal seam,
AM | 2Sans | 362x862 b 24 s Protmastor ONLY | 2500/cin NOBID Staples 916179 $ 119.95
" while wove, gummed, Avpexine (poly) patch sl o - &
#10 SECURITY standard winddw, dagonal seam, whis
A3S cins | 4125%05 sub 24 L A ) Prrtmaster ONLY 2500/cn NOBID Staples 918161 s 136.00 Uiiisanmae Wireon Staples.

10f2




DUTCHESS BOCES PRINT SHOP SUPPLIES BID #2526-30
Contract Period: March 12, 2026 through March 11, 2027
w/ four optional one-year exiensions

Secondary Award
#36 | 240cms | ar2sx0s sibza | MIOTeOMr clagonal seam. white wove. gummed haed | o omy | 2s00/n NOBID Stagies 187013 5 6865
o indenmeyr Munros Staples
#10 standard window, dagonal seam, while wove,
5 b Printmast ¥ 2500/ NO B Staphes 1 7
aar | 1eocms | a125x08 B2 | ved, Mvaxina (ooly) saich hard be i o ki) BES g b indonmeyr Munroe Staples
#10 Postage Mater Styla, window, white wove, gummed
Ase| vaicins | 428308 =024 | (FLAP ON BOTTON) ERGORNRONY)| o s SO Lindenmeyt Munos A
#10 Postage Meter Style, SECURITY windaw, whita ~
A% | 20ans | 4125x08 sb2e | L umimed (FLAR ON BOTTOM) Printmaster ONLY | 2500%ctn Lot indanmeyr Murvos A
A0 Scins [ 45x10375 sub28 | #11 regular, ciagonal seam, brown krat, gummed fap | Prictmaster ONLY | 2500/ctn NOBID [ i
A Sars | 475x11 sub28 | ®12regular, ciagonal seam, brown kiaf, gummed flap | Printmaster ONLY | 2500/ctn NOBID Staples 535153 166,
raf, g P $ 2 Lindenmeyr Munros Staples.
Az Scirs | 475x11 sub24 | #12 regular, ciagonal seam, whie wove, gummed flap | Printmaster ONLY | 2500/ctn NOBID B 2633035 s 29980
Commerca Lindenmeyr Munroe Staples.
a3 Scns | 5x115 sub28 | #14 regular, ciagonal seam, brown ksl gummed flap | Prntmaster ONLY | 2500/ctn NOBID NOBID ’ i
Add dans | Bx9 sub28 | 6 x9Cataiog white wove, open end. gummed Printmaser ONLY s00/ctn NO BID Staples. 247668 s 35.10 Lindenmeyr Murvos Staplos
ms | oo | sxu2 sub28 | 912 Catalog. brown kraft, open end, Glear Clasp Cualty Park 500/ctn NOBID NOBD # itk
A6 | toons | 10x13 sub 28 | 1013 Calalog, brown kah, open end, Clear Clasp Cuaity Park 500/ctn NOBID HO BID Stagies WA
A7 dans | ex12 sub28 | 9x12 Catalog, white wove, open end, gummed Printmaster ONLY S00/cn NOBID Staples 455ess 5 7578 z " s
AAE Acns [ ox12 $ub 78 | 9 17 Cotalog, while wowe, open end, Poel n Seal Proimester ONLY 500cin NO BID Stagles. AT9885 3 7364 Lindenmeyr Munroe Staples
A4D dcns | 6x9 sub28 | 6x8 . whiie wove, open end, Peel 'n Seal Prntmaster ONLY S00/cin NOBID Stagies £92099 s 5310 Lindonmeyr Munoa Staples
ASD | f0cws | 10x13 sUb 28| 1013 Calalog whie wove, open end, Peel n Seal Frntmaster ONLY 500/cin NG BID Stagies 470885 3 7598 Lindenmeyr Munvoe Staples
as1 | sans | 6o sub28 | 6x8 Thumb Cut, brown krat. apen end ANY 500/ctn NOBID NO BID Stapies MO BID NO BID
JAMBig Name:
4
AS2 ans | 65x95 sub28 | 6.5x 85 Catalog, white wove, open end, gummed Printmaster ONLY 500/ctn NG BID bl 24052387 5 8450 e i
As3 | t5etns | 1117 CF | Reverse Black Image - Writo * Appleton 2500/ctn NOBID Lindsnmsyr Munros HiA
AS4 16ans | 1117 CF | Reverse Black Image - Canary, Pink, Gold * Appleton 2500/etn NO BID Lindanmeyr Munroa MIA
ass | sans | 11x17 GF | Reverse Black Image - Green, Blue * Appletor 4000/ctn ~NBO |4t b ] indenmeyr Munron [y
Ase | 24ctns | 11x17 CB | Revarse Black Image - White * Appleton 2500/ctn NOBID Lindshmays Munve rA
As? | 10ans | 1117 €8 | Reverse Black Image - Al Colors * Appleton 2000/ctn NCBID Lindenmeyr Munroa A
Ass | tsems | 11x17 CFB | Reverse Black Image - Vihite * Aspletan 2500ictn NOBID Lindenmeyr Muneae A
ase | sems | 11x17 CFB | Reverss Black Image - Carary, Pink * Acpleton 25006ctn NOBID i WA
A80 | 1scns | 11217 CFB | Reverse Biack Image - Gold, Green, Blus * Agpleton 4000ictn NOBID Lirdanmeyr Munvos WA
A6t | s | 11x17 201 | Reverse Block Image Aopleton [1250 satsicin NO BID L Murvoe A
asz| soans | 11x17 3pt | Reverse Black Image Aspleton 835 setsictn NO BID Lindenmeyr Munvoe WA
463 | eaens [ 11x17 45t | Reverse Black image Aapleton 625 setsictn NOBID Lindenmeyr Munvoa A
a4 | eoons | 11x17 Spt | Reverse Bisck image Aopleton 500 setsictn NO BID Lindermeyr Murvos A
AES 10ce | 225x348 75pt | CF Tag- Wnite 1058 Aspleton BOOVCn NOBD Lindarmayr Munros NA
A86 Goins | 225x345 750t | CF Tag- Manda 1054 Aapleton 800kt NO BID Lindenmeyr Munios A
AGT | 30Boxes | 2x4 White Agdress Labels Avery 5163 Avery ONLY 1001 noe AVERY 260273
tabelzbos] Staples Cull
A58 | 15Boxes | 31354 Wihite Address Labels Avery 5164 Avery ONLY NOBID AVERY 260265
il S labelsbox Stapies Qi
AGS | 10 Boxes | 36"x 100" 260gsm | Premium Luster Phata Paper (260) 150% Text Epson 1 Roll NO BID HP TS13852651 5 19789 Lindenmayr Munros Staples
AT0 | 10Boxes | 25" x250° ™ Standard Gloss Laminating Film 17 Poly Claar SouthWest 2 Rolls/box| NO BID GHG 547851 5 10311 L Alieos. Staples
ATY | 10Boxes | 18*x 250’ 3wt Standard Gloss Laminating Film 17 Poly Clear SouthWest 2 Rolis/box] NO BID Lindenmeyr Munrae HiA
AT2 | 10Boxes | 12'x 250" 3 i Standard Gloss Laminating Film 1° Poly Clear SouhiWast 2 Rolis/bax] NO BID Lindormeyr Munios A
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DUTCHESS BOCES PRINT SHOP SUPPLIES BID #2526-30
Contract Period: March 12, 2026 through March 11, 2027
w/ four optional one-year extensions

Mark Andy Quill Staples
D 2 D 0 OCK # Secondary Award
E1 STIC CUTTING STICK 1/2° X 1/2° X 30-1/2" 6/ P; NO BID Mark Andy WA
B2__|CHALLENGE 1/4~ HOLE_ 2-172- CAPACITY TEFLON-COATED 1/ NO BID Mark HIA
B3 __|T100S QC 20X25X0.037" STICKY BACK BLKT Each NO BID Mark Andy A
Offeet Prozs Blanket- 0.085 mm Thicknoss, blue, with comparable durabilty and | Compalible with AB Each
B4 |print performance. OEM reference RESILD372025 or equal. Dick Air Tack systems NO BID Mark Andy A
Offset Press Blanket- 16 7/8" x 19 1/8°, with equivalent material composition and  |Compatible with Ryobi Each
BS nce charactenistics. DEM reference 67001035 or equal. 500H offset presses NO BID NO BID NO BID
B6__|100- CLEANER SHTS 11X18-5/8 PB ABDICK 380 B800SER PK (PACKAGE NO BID Mark Andy HA
B7 EAN FREE DISPOSABLE SHOP CLOTHS 13° X 13° | | 375/ Case 144.48|NO BID | Il Staples | Mark Andy
BS__|COTTON LITHO PADS 4” X 4™ CASE 100 PADS/PACK. 20 Packs NO BID Mark And WA
B9 |100- ICTP PLATE 11X16-5/8 6MIL BX(BOX) NO BID Mark Andy WA
B10_[100- ICTP PLATE 15X19 EMIL BX(BOX) NG BI Mark Andy NIA
B11_ |6 MONTH SERVICE KIT PW2000 Each NO Bl Mark Andy. HIA
B12_[ICTP DELETION PEN BROAD TIP G&. Each NO Bl Mark Andy NiA
B13_[ICTP DELETION PEN FINE TIP G&. Each NO Bl Mark Andy NiA
B14 [10 LITER ICTP FINISHER GUM G8. Each NO Bl Mark Andy NiA
B15_[2UP ICTP CLEAN FLUID 1X100ML G&. 100ML Bottle INO Bl Mark Andy NIA
B16_[IPLATE CLEANER GA. 1 Liter NO Bl Mark Andy NIA
B17 _[ICTP CLEANING STICKS REFILL G&J 50 I Pack NO BID Mark Andy NA
818 [MAINTENANCE FLUID CTG3-8 2X110ML Ga. Set NO BID Mark Andy NA
[B19_[LIQUID DOT CTG 182 2X110ML GAJ Set NO BID Mark Andy NiA
4 11 i1 G&l Sat NO BID Mark Andy HIA
821 _|2UP iICTP MAINTENANCE KIT G&J Each NO BID Mark RIA
[B22 |COLOR BRIDGE COATED/UNCOATED PANTONE Each [NO BID Mark Andy WA
B23 ICLASSIC PLUS 210850 BLACK VAN SON L Can NO BID Mark Andy RNiA
B24 |UNIPACK PANTONE® 873 GOLD VAN SON 2LB Can INO BID Mark Andy NIA
B25_|UNIPACK PANTONE® 877 SILVER VAN SON .2LB Can NO BID Mark Andy RIA
B26_|CLASSIC PLUS PANTONE® REFLEX BLUE 2.2LB VAN SON  2LB Can NO BID Mark Andy N/A
B27 |CLASSIC PLUS AMAZON GREEN VAN SON 118 Can INO BID Mark Andy RiA
B28 |CLASSIC PLUS PMS 347 VY MINT GREEN VAN SON 1LB Can NO BID Mark Andy NIA
B29 _|5LB-VS CLASSIC PLUS SPEC MIX INK CN (CAN, NOC BID Mark And: NIA
B30 _|PRESSURE SENTIVITE WHITE UNCOATED 17-1/4X22-1/4 STRATA 500/ Pack NO BID Mark And: NIA
831 _[12MONTH SERVICE KIT PW2000 Each NO BID Mark Andy NiA
832_[IDLER TIRES FOR GRAPHIC WIZARD Each NO BID Mark Andy NiA
B33_|PK OF 24 - FELT CLEANING SEALS A{Each NO BID Mark Andy NA
B33 |BEARING A{Each NO BID Mark Andy NiA
B35_|BLADE, INK FTN RYOBI 5201 EA(Each| NO BID Mark N/A
BJ5_|ANCHOR® EMERALD PREMIUM MXEH #2912 1 Gallon NO BID Mark Andy A
B37_|BURNISHINE PLATE SAV-UR® 1 Quart NO BID Mark Andy NIA
B33 _|ABDICK WATER MISCIBLE WASH SGalion Pail NO Bi Mark Andy WA
B33 _|[VARNE V-120 WATER MISCIBLE WASH S5Galion Pail NO BID Mark Andy NA
B40_|3LB-VARN TAKE IT OFF Each NO BID Mark Andy WA
B41 _IVARN® 100% PURE GUM ARABIC SOLUTION 1 Gallon NO BID Mark NA
B42 |3 mil, 1" poly clear - 18x250 Each NO BID Mark Andy NA
Each 2800021
SOLD 2
B43 |3 mil, 1" poly clear- 25x250 GBC RLBX $110.64 Mark Andy Staples
B44_|Gloss Lominating Film, 2 mil thickness, 11.3- x 328" Revo Office 4 rolls/ case O BID NO EID NO BID NO BID
B45_[10mm, wilissue, clear uare comer, 44-hole (248 piich) 8 % x 11" Each NO BID NO BID NO BID
Black and Clear; 4.1 Pitch; 12" length Each INO BID NO BID NO BID
Gmm| ach NO BID NO BID NO BID
Emm| ach NO BID NO BID NO BID
10mm ach NO BID HO BID NO EID
imm ach NO BID NO BID NOBID
2mm ach INO BID NO BID NO BID
3mm) ach NO BID NO BID NO BID
4mm| ach NO BID NO BID NOBID
6mm| Each [NO BID NO BID NOBID
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DUTCHESS BOCES PRINT SHOP SUPPLIES BID #2526-30
Contract Period: March 12, 2026 through March 11, 2027
w/ four optional one-year extensions

B55 18mm| Each NG BID INO BID NO BID
B56 Clear Linen White — Clear Matte/Linen Backs Thermal (11 x 8.5, Portrail Each NO BID INO BID RiA
B57 S 2 " Each NO BID NO BID NO BID
ES8 Spina Widtha: 1/8" ach INO BID NO BID NO BID
B59 Spina Widths: 1/4” ach NO BID INO BID NO BID
BE0 Spine Widths: 3/8" ach NO BID INO BID NO EBID
B&1 Spine Widths: 1/2° ach NG EID [NC BID NOEID
B62 Spine Widths: 5/8° ach [NO BID NO BID NO BID
B563 Spine Widths: /4" ach NO BID NO BID NOEBID
B54 S Widths: 1° Each NO BID NO BID NO BID
BE5 |12- #82 SUCKER Dozen ! Package NO BID WA

Sucker feet- compatible with AB Dick offsel presses or equivalent equipment. Must

meet OEM specifications for fit, material, and performance. AB Dick OEM Part Dozen | Package
BE6_|#084248 or egual. NO BID NiA
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DUTCHESS BOCES PRINT SHOP SUPPLIES BID #2526-30
Contract Period: March 12, 2026 through March 11, 2027
w/ four optional one-year extensions

ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT (Percentage Off Manufacturer List Price / Catalog / Website)

Vendors may offer additional discounts on products not listed on the Paper Products or Other Supplies tabs.

These discounts will apply to items purchased during the contract term.

Calego! Produt Type

Discount Offered (% Z

| ':Wérded ‘Vendor: Quill :

Basis for Discount Chose One) Brand(s) / Line(s) Covered

Notes / Exclusions

Printing / Press Supplies 10% Vendor Website Various Pleasg see attached lefter for discounts &
exclusions

Bindery & Finishing Supplies 10% Vendor Website Vaitoizs Pleas_e see altached letter for discounts &
exclusions

Clean_mg & Maintenance 10% Vendor Website Varisius Pleasg see attached letter for discounts &

Supplies exclusions

OEM-Compatible 10% Vendor Website Various Pleas.e see attached letter for discounts &

Consumables exclusions

All Other Non-Listed Products 10% Vendor Website Various ezt;z:;::e aitached letter for discounts &




DUTCHESS BOCES PRINT SHOP SUPPLIES BID #2526-30

Contract Period: March 12, 2026 through March 11, 2027
w/ four optional one-year extensions

Company Name:

Lindenmeyr Munroe

Company Name:

Mark Andy

Contact Name:

Michael Gorman

Contact Name:

Kristin Duddles

Contact Number:

Office: 518-471-5111 ext. 5113

Contact Email:

mgorman@lindenmeyr.com

Contact Number:

Office: 800.225.4835 x3260

Contact Email:

Kristin.Duddles@markandy.com

Additional Information:

Additional Information:

Company Name:

Quill LLC

Company Name:

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC

Contact Name:

Sarah Sherman

Contact Name:

Danielle Feher, Senior Account Executive, Public Sector

Contact Number:

800-634-4809

Contact Number:

(407) 475-4434

Contact Email:

bid@quill.cem

Contact Email:

Danielle.Feher@Staples.com

Additional Information:

Additional Information:

Please include Quill Bid # 26-40968 on all purchase orders.

For items using this contract: send Purchase Order to Danielle.Feher@Staples.com

Company Name:

W.B. Mason Co. Inc.

Contact Name:

Ryan Driscoll

Contact Number:

631-316-0052

Contact Email:

ryan.driscoll@wbmason.com

Additional Information:
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