

k:\board items\board meeting items\2024-25\11 - may 14, 2025\bids\cooperative fresh baked bread & brewad products bid 2425-02.docx

DUTCHESS COUNTY BOCES BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES
5 BOCES Road
Poughkeepsie, NY 12601

**COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD & BREAD PRODUCTS BID #2425-02 –
Extension #1**

Current Extension: July 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026
Original Contract Period: July 1, 2022 through June 30, 2023
(with the Option to Extend Up to Three (3) One-Year Extensions)

The undersigned agrees to supply the service and products described within that has been bid pursuant to the terms of the bid and the terms of the "Special Instructions to Bidders and General Conditions of the Contract" which are incorporated as part of the original bid document by reference to them on this cover sheet.

Company

Name:

Rockland Bakery Inc

Name of

Contact:

Domenica Battaglia

Address:

94 Demarest Mill Rd.

Nanuet, NY 10954

Telephone:

845-623-5800

Fax Number:

Email:

dbattaglia@rocklandbakery.com

Signature:

Domenica Battaglia

Date:

4/3/2025

DUTCHESS COUNTY BOCES BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES
5 BOCES Road
Poughkeepsie, NY 12601

**COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD & BREAD PRODUCTS BID #2425-02 –
Extension #1**

Current Extension: July 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026

Original Contract Period: July 1, 2022 through June 30, 2023
(with the Option to Extend Up to Three (3) One-Year Extensions)

The undersigned agrees to supply the service and products described within that has been bid pursuant to the terms of the bid and the terms of the "Special Instructions to Bidders and General Conditions of the Contract" which are incorporated as part of the original bid document by reference to them on this cover sheet.

Company

Name:

Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.

Name of

Contact:

Angela Bell

Address:

428 Westridge Pkwy

McDonough, GA 30253

Telephone:

404-623-8975

Fax Number:

Email:

BBUFSBids@grupobimbo.com angela.bell@grupobimbo.com

Signature:

Angela Bell

Date:

4/2/2025

NOTE: Bid Items 1-18 must be at least 51% Whole Grain. The remainder of grains must be enriched. SLICED BREAD - DO NOT COUNT ENDS IN USABLE SLICE COUNT.				VENDOR NAME: Rockland Bakery, Inc.				VENDOR NAME: Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc. *Bimbo will only provide to: DC Boces, Pine Plains CSD, Poughkeepsie City SD, Spackenkill UFSD			
BID ITEM #	SCHOOL DISTRICT PROJECTED USAGE 2024-2025	DESCRIPTION - All Products Must Meet USDA Grain Requirements	UNIT OF MEASURE (UOM)	MEETS BUY AMERICAN PROVISION (YES OR NO)	UNIT OF MEASURE BID, IF DIFFERENT FROM BID SPEC	VENDOR CATALOG #	PRICE PER UOM	MEETS BUY AMERICAN PROVISION (YES OR NO)	UNIT OF MEASURE BID, IF DIFFERENT FROM BID SPEC	VENDOR CATALOG #	PRICE PER UOM
1	0	BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, MINI, SLICED, 1.8 OZ/EA	12/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
2	638	BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, SLICED, 2.4 OZ/EA (HS/MS ONLY)	12/PACK	YES		1462-02	5.32				NO BID
3	277	BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, SLICED, 4 OZ/EA (HS ONLY)	12/PACK	YES		0173-02	5.40				NO BID
4	NEW	BREAD, CRACKED WHEAT, 1.3 oz SLICE, MIN. 51% WHOLE GRAIN	LOAF - 16 Useable Slices/LOAF	YES		NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
5	NEW	BREAD, HEARTY FLAXSEED, 1.3 OZ SLICE, MIN. 51% WHOLE GRAIN	LOAF - 16 Useable Slices/LOAF	YES		NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
6	NEW	BREAD, OAT BRAN, 1.3 OZ SLICE, MIN. 51% WHOLE GRAIN	LOAF - 16 Useable Slices/LOAF	YES		NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
7	4994	BREAD, STUB -100% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT - 1 OZ/SLICE CREDITING 1 OZ GR EQ/SLICE	LOAF - 22 Useable Slices/LOAF			NO BID	NO BID	YES		6377	2.55
8	4808	BREAD, WHOLE GRAIN WHITE, 1 OZ/SLICE CREDITING 1oz GR EQ/SLICE	LOAF - 20 Useable Slices/LOAF	YES	26 USABLE	0244-01	2.30	YES		3239	2.50
9	178	BREAD, FRENCH BREAD, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, 15 OZ LOAF	LOAF	YES		1409-01	1.85				NO BID
10	702	CLUB ROLL, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, SLICED, 4", 2.4 OZ/EA (HS/MS ONLY)	12/PACK	YES		1410-02	3.76				NO BID
11	988	CLUB ROLL, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, SLICED, 6", 3 OZ/EA (HS ONLY)	12/PACK	YES		1433-02	3.88	YES	6ct - 2oz	6375	2.10
12	NEW	ROLL, DINNER, MIN. 51% CRACKED WHEAT, 1.8 OZ/EA.	10/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
13	120	ROLL, DINNER, 51% WHEAT, BREAKAWAY, 1.17 OZ/EA	12/PACK			NO BID	NO BID	YES	12ct	5397	2.16
14	4836	ROLL, DINNER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, 1.5 OZ/EA	12/PACK	YES	16 PK	1460-01	3.97				NO BID
15	12,746	ROLL, HAMBURGER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, SLICED, 2.15 OZ/EA CREDITING 2.00 OZ GR EQ/SLICE	12/PACK	YES		1485-01	2.20	YES	100% Whole Wheat - 2.19oz ea 2gr eq	5392	4.08
16	779	ROLL, HAMBURGER, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, SLICED, 2 OZ/EA	16/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
17	1900	ROLL, HOT DOG, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, 2.15 OZ/EA CREDITING 2.00 OZ GR EQ/SLICE	12/PACK	YES		1486-01	2.20	YES	100% Whole Wheat - 2.19oz ea 2gr eq	5393	4.08

BID ITEM #	SCHOOL DISTRICT PROJECTED USAGE 2024-2025	DESCRIPTION - All Products Must Meet USDA Grain Requirements	UNIT OF MEASURE	MEETS BUY AMERICAN PROVISION (YES OR NO)	UNIT OF MEASURE BID, IF DIFFERENT FROM BID SPEC.	VENDOR CATALOG #	PRICE PER UOM	MEETS BUY AMERICAN PROVISION (YES OR NO)	UNIT OF MEASURE BID, IF DIFFERENT FROM BID SPEC.	VENDOR CATALOG #	PRICE PER UOM
18	0	ROLL, HOT DOG, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, 2 OZ/EA	16/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
19	1850	ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, SLICED, 1.8 OZ/EA	12/PACK	YES		1407-02	3.64				NO BID
20	304	ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN, 4" DIAM, SLICED, 2 OZ/EA	12/PACK	YES		1405-02 (2.4 oz each) See Item 22 below.	3.72			3242	3.12
21	2674	ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, SLICED, 2.4 OZ/EA (HS/MS ONLY)	12/PACK	YES		1405-02	3.72				NO BID
22	154	ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, SLICED, 3.5 OZ/EA (HS ONLY); CREDITING AS 3.00 OZ GR EQ/EA	12/PACK	YES		1431-02	3.88				NO BID
		THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE NOT WHOLE GRAIN									
23	0	Bagel Sticks	144/cs			NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
24	332	BAGELS, 4 OZ, ASSORTED, SLICED, (NOT WG)	12/PACK	YES		0125-01	#N/A				NO BID
25	0	BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, CINNAMON RAISIN, SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
26	182	BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, PLAIN, SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK	YES		0342-02	#N/A				NO BID
27	0	BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, POPPY, SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
28	0	BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, SESAME, SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
29	139	BAGELS, 4 OZ, CINNAMON RAISIN, SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK	YES		0175-02	5.40				NO BID
30	146	BAGELS, 4 OZ, EVERYTHING, SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK	YES		0172-02	5.40				NO BID
31	6	BAGELS, 4 OZ., MARBLE, SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK	YES		0345-02	5.40				NO BID
32	2125	BAGELS, 4 OZ, PLAIN, SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK	YES		0165-02	5.40				NO BID
33	264	BAGELS, 4 OZ, SESAME, SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK	YES		0167-02	5.40				NO BID
34	10542	BREAD, FRENCH STYLE	SOL EA	YES		0108-01	1.85				NO BID

BID ITEM #	SCHOOL DISTRICT PROJECTED USAGE 2024-2025	DESCRIPTION - All Products Must Meet USDA Grain Requirements	UNIT OF MEASURE (UOM)	MEETS BUY AMERICAN PROVISION (YES OR NO)	UNIT OF MEASURE BID, IF DIFFERENT FROM BID SPEC.	VENDOR CATALOG #	PRICE PER UOM	MEETS BUY AMERICAN PROVISION (YES OR NO)	UNIT OF MEASURE BID, IF DIFFERENT FROM BID SPEC.	VENDOR CATALOG #	PRICE PER UOM
		THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE NOT WHOLE GRAIN									
35	0	CLUB ROLL, 4" SOFT CRUST, SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				NO BID
36	0	CLUB ROLL, 6" SLICED (NOT WG)	12/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				
37	0	HARD ROLLS; KAISER, 3.5 OZ, ONION (NOT WG)	12/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				
38	808	HARD ROLLS; KAISER, 3.5 OZ, PLAIN (NOT WG)	12/PACK	YES		0402-02	3.88				
39	48	MINI DANISH	EA	YES		0499-01	10.84				
40	1902	DANISH ASSORTED	EA	YES		0844-01	16.22				
41	34	MUFFINS, MINI ASSORTED	12/PACK	YES		0490-01	10.20				
42	180	MUFFINS, LARGE ASSORTED	12/PACK	YES		0844-01	16.22				
43	14	DONUTS, LARGE ASSORTED	12/PACK	YES		0593-01	10.32				
44	0	PASTRY, LARGE ASSORTED	12/PACK			NO BID	NO BID				